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Subject: Re: AIMS Enforcement APl Quotation
From: "W. Patrick Flanary" <wpflanar@ncsu.edu>
Date: 11/24/2014 5:24 PM

To: Ronnie Bowen <rnbowen@ncsu.edu>

Ok, thanks for the info. I'll get Lashawn to add it into the PO for both. Yes, | think we can definitely
find the cash drawers and printers cheaper online if we need to replace them. Thanks!

Pat

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 5:18 PM, Ronnie Bowen <rnbowen@ncsu.edu> wrote:

In order for the handhelds to be able to talk to the Luke meters to be able to display which spaces
are expired or paid we need this module.

Apparently we had not made or finalized our plans about the new Lukes/Passport when Ellen
configured our quote.

We need to get this added to the PO.

We also need to pay them about $400 for the ability to do Secure FTP, but maybe that can be done
on a small purchase. We also haven't finalized whether our old receipt printers and cash drawers
will need replacing - but we can probably get them cheaper online.

RB

RB

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 4:52 PM, W. Patrick Flanary <wpflanar@ncsu.edu> wrote:
Do you know what this is?

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Ellen Genung <ellen@aimsparking.com>

Date: Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 4:32 PM

Subject: AIMS Enforcement APl Quotation

To: Catherine Reeve <cgreeve2 @ncsu.edu>, "W. Patrick Flanary" <wpflanar@ncsu.edu>

Hi Cathy and Pat -

Per our conversation on Friday, attached is a quote for the AIMS Enforcement API. This will
enable real-time communication between multi-space meter, pay-by-phone and LPR systems for
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enforcement.

Let me know if you have any questions.

| wish you both a fantastic Thanksgiving!

Ellen

Ellen Genung
EDC Corporation

ellen@aimsparking.com

800-886-6316 (w)
315-427-5236 (c)
315-706-0330 (f)

W. Patrick Flanary
Assistant Director for Finance

Transportation

NC State University

(919)-515-8000

W. Patrick Flanary

Assistant Director for Finance

Transportation
NC State University
(919)-515-8000
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