From: Jaime Matthews

Sent: 6/14/2021 2:25:49 PM
To: "Marcus Harvey" <mharveyl@unca.edu>
Cc:

Subject: Re: Compensation Question

Great! We will work on getting them processed on our end. The funding will be processed in the next fiscal year,
so we expect checks to go out the first week of July.

On Mon, Jun 14, 2021 at 2:49 PM Marcus Harvey <mharveyl@unca.edu> wrote:
Hi Jaime,

I've already completed and submitted the forms.
Marcus

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 14, 2021, at 2:34 PM, Jaime Matthews <Jmatthews@ashevillenc.gov> wrote:

Good Afternoon Dr. Harvey,
Please follow the instructions on the attached form and then we will be able to process payment. I believe

they will send a check to the address provided in the form, but I need to double check on that. Please let
me know if you have any questions or need assistance.

Thank you,

Jaime

https://docs.google.com/document/d/IURfWLIpV-Ajh4mYA 1i-nNVgTI1Ws75W3PuCP-rh8KP2w/edit

E Vendor Reqistry

On Mon, Jun 14, 2021 at 2:06 PM Marcus Harvey <mharveyl@unca.edu> wrote:
Hello Jaimie,

I hope you’re doing well. I'm writing to inquire as to how and when speaker series participants will
receive their agreed upon compensation.

Regards,
Marcus
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Sent from my iPhone
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