RE: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

From: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>
To: Higdon, Garrett B <gbhigdon@ncdot.gov>, Jamison, Wesley A <wjamison@ncdot.gov>
Sent: June 3, 2021 11:29:35 AM EDT

| would request it as soon as you have the document (cannot do it before then).
Joshua B. Deyton, PE

Division 14 Project Team Lead

North Carolina Department of Transportation

828 586 2141 office

jbdeyton@ncdot.gov

Highway Division 14

253 Webster Rd.

Sylva, NC 28779

From: Higdon, Garrett B <gbhigdon@ncdot.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 3, 2021 11:14 AM

To: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>; Jamison, Wesley A <wjamison@ncdot.gov>

Subject: RE: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

The current ROW date for B-3186/B-5898 is in August but we were going to attempt to pull it in when we get the
document ready so that Frankie and his group could start ASAP. How do you want us to handle that project?

Thanks,

Garrett Higdon, El

Assistant Bridge Management Engineer

Division 14

North Carolina Department of Transportation

828-508-2448 ( Cell)

828-488-0902 (Office)

gbhigdon@ncdot.gov

345 Toot Hollow Rd

Bryson City, NC 28713
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Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the North Carolina Public Records Law and may be
disclosed to third parties.

From: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 3, 2021 10:54 AM

To: Jamison, Wesley A <wjamison@ncdot.gov>

Cc: Higdon, Garrett B <gbhigdon@ncdot.gov>; Mcdowell, Kenneth J <kjmcdowell@ncdot.gov>; Mosteller, Barry D
<bdmosteller@ncdot.gov>; Oberhausen, Stacy B <soberhausen@ncdot.gov>; White, Jeanette L
<jlwhite5@ncdot.gov>

Subject: RE: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

Wes,

I think this is correct. Some of the others that are starting then (R-5600 and R-2588B) have already had funds set up.

To all,

Please let us know if we have overlooked any of your projects that are starting R/W in July, but have not been funded
(you may need to check in SAP or Connect site to see).

Thanks,

Joshua B. Deyton, PE

Division 14 Project Team Lead

North Carolina Department of Transportation
828 586 2141 office

jbdeyton@ncdot.gov

Highway Division 14

253 Webster Rd.

Sylva, NC 28779

From: Jamison, Wesley A <wjamison@ncdot.gov>
Sent: Thursday, June 3, 2021 8:31 AM

To: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>

Subject: RE: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

For this project | had to get Dave to do a consultation on the document which was completed yesterday. | will put in the
request for R/W funds today.

R-5799 — Funds have been requested and released. There is $7.2mil available currently

R-5861 - Funds have been requested and released. There is $2.5mil available currently
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These are the only active projects | see listed that start R/W in July. If there are any more let me know.

Wesley A. Jamison, P.E.

Bridge Program Manager

Division 14 Bridge Management

North Carolina Department of Transportation
828 586 2141 office

wjamison@ncdot.gov

From: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 9:55 PM

To: Jamison, Wesley A <wjamison@ncdot.gov>

Subject: FW: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

Wes,

Do you know if funding has been requested for any projects starting right of way in July?

Joshua B. Deyton, PE

Division 14 Project Team Lead

North Carolina Department of Transportation
828 586 2141 office

jbdeyton@ncdot.gov

Highway Division 14

253 Webster Rd.

Sylva, NC 28779

From: Austin, Wanda H <whaustin@ncdot.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 4:24 PM
To: Dills, Frankie J <fdills@ncdot.gov>

Cc: Deyton, Joshua B <jbdeyton@ncdot.gov>
Subject: RE: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

The Division plans to move forward with r/w acquisition in July 2021. A funding request will be submitted for the July

BOT.

Josh,

Please get with Wes and ensure this request as well as others that are slated for July have been submitted.
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Wanda H. Austin, PE CPM

Division Engineer

From: Dills, Frankie J <fdills@ncdot.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 2:33 PM

To: Austin, Wanda H <whaustin@ncdot.gov>

Subject: R-5600 Par 044 Sheet 7

Hey Wanda,

Raleigh is going to want a email or memo from you stating that yes we are moving forward with this project since it
does not have R/W authorization as of yet. | have attached a set of plans with the parcel in question. It is parcel 44 on
plan sheet 7 (sheet 5) as you scroll.

Thanks

Frankie J. Dills Jr.

Division Right of Way Agent

Right of Way Division 14

North Carolina Department of Transportation

828 586 4040 office

828 586 6253 fax

fdills@ncdot.gov

1594 East Main Street

Sylva, North Carolina 28779

Email correspondence to and from this address is subject to the

North Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties

Email correspondence to and from this sender is subject to the N.C. Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third
parties.
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