From: Lindsay Welch

To: Lindsay Welch
Subject: Fwd: Revised AVS Quote
Date: Wednesday, June 15, 2022 10:21:25 AM
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Lindsay Welch <bbgwelch@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Apr 28, 2021 at 10:24

Subject: Re: Revised AVS Quote

To: Scott Drew <sdr wilson- m>

I forwarded it to Scott. Let me know if he sends it to you.

Thanks
Lindsay

On Wed, Apr 28, 2021 at 10:23 Lindsay Welch <bbgwelch@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sandy Graves <SGra helmsbri m>
Date: Thu, Apr 22, 2021 at 10:07

Subject: Revised AVS Quote

To: lindsay <bbgwelch@gmail.com>

Lindsay,
Attached is the revised AV quote from AVS Coastal. This one contains the labor fee for setup and strike. It

requires a signature at the bottom. Once it is signed, you can send it back to me and I'll forward it on to Greg at
AVS for a countersignature. Let me know if you have any questions.

Sandy Graves, CMP, CASE

Senior Director, Global Accounts
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