
From: Sunrise Recovery <sunriserecoverybooks@gmail.com>
Sent: 10/4/2021 8:20:52 AM
To: Christina Harris <charris@ashevillenc.gov>
Cc: Emily Ball <eball@ashevillenc.gov>,Paul D'Angelo <pdangelo@ashevillenc.gov>,Jonathon Jones <jjones2@ashevillenc.gov>,Tom Downing <tdowning@ashevillenc.gov>,Sue Polston <spolston@sunriseinasheville.org>,Larry Thompson <let3@charter.net>
Subject: Re: Draw documentation
Attachments: Sunrise Inv 8110- Sept 3 proof payroll.pdf,Sunrise Inv 8111- Sept 17 proof payroll.pdf

Good morning all,
Please find proof of payroll for invoices 8110 and 8111 in the attached copies of our bank statement.
If you need anything further, let me know.
Thank you,
Chantal

On Wed, Sep 29, 2021 at 1:33 PM Christina Harris <charris@ashevillenc.gov> wrote:
Hi Chantal,

I hope this email finds you well.Â 

Emily is going to be out all next week so when you have the proof of paymentÂ ( cancelled check or bank statement - please redact sensitive information) please send this information to me and I can update your file. Also, if you could get Sunrise's proof of payment to us on Monday, October 4, 2021 in the morning
there is a possibility that we can review and submit for payment to have a check mailed out to Sunrise Recovery on Friday, October 8th.Â 

Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.Â 

Â 
Respectfully,Â 

Christina HarrisÂ 
Community Development CoordinatorÂ 
Community & Economic Development DepartmentÂ 
Office:Â 828 - 251- 4017
Email:Â charris@ashevillenc.gov

IfÂ you would like to know more about the Community Development Division or would like to be added to our Community Development Listserv for monthly updates please fill out the google form foundÂ here. If you have any questions relatedÂ to the draw request processÂ please
emailÂ Â cddrawrequest@ashevillenc.gov. IfÂ you have concerns regarding our homeless community, please call 211.Â 

Â Â 

On Wed, Sep 29, 2021 at 9:38 AM Sunrise Recovery <sunriserecoverybooks@gmail.com> wrote:
The Sept bank statement is not available until after Oct 1st. Both 8110 and 8111 payrolls landed in Sept.
I could provide a print out from online banking showing the draw if that satisfies the request?Â 
If this request is for prior invoices and not 8110-8111 please let me know which, those are available on statements.

Thanks
Chantal

On Mon, Sep 27, 2021 at 2:26 PM Emily Ball <eball@ashevillenc.gov> wrote:
Hi Chantal,

It looks like those two most recent draws didn't include proof of payment for payroll - would you be able to send that?Â  We'd be looking for (redacted) bank records that show
that the direct deposit/checks were processed.Â  I've copied Christina from our team here in case she wants to add anything further or in case you have questions.Â  Thanks!

Emily Ball
Homeless Services System Performance Lead
City of Asheville
O: 828.271.6129
C: 828.747.8510
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