
From: CD Draw Request <cddrawrequest@ashevillenc.gov>
Sent: 1/10/2022 8:50:17 AM
To: Sunrise Recovery <sunriserecoverybooks@gmail.com>
Cc: Emily Ball <eball@ashevillenc.gov>,Larry Thompson <let3@charter.net>,Jacqui Derreberry <jderreberry@sunriseinasheville.org>,Sue Polston <spolston@sunriseinasheville.org>
Subject: Re: Sunrise Covide Shelter #8118 12/4-12/17 2021

Thank you for submitting the Sunrise Invoice 8118 Invoice, it has been received.

If we have any questions or concerns we will be in contact with you.

On Mon, Jan 10, 2022 at 8:39 AM Sunrise Recovery <sunriserecoverybooks@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello again,
Here is this period's invoice and back up.

Thanks,
Chantal
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